Morton County Commission Meeting Agenda

September 14, 2017

Commission Room, Morton County Courthouse
210 2" Ave NW, Mandan ND

5:30 PM

Call to order
Roll Call
Approval of Agenda
Approval of minutes for previous meetings
Approve monthly bills and payroll — Commissioner Zachmeier

1. Greg Runge/Mental Health Attorney
e  Summary of 2016 Cases

2. Al Fitterer Architect
e  Award bids for court room remodel

i Grav/NDSLE on Servi
o+ Introductionof New-ANR Agent

4. Vicki Lippert/Treasurer
e  Pledge of Securities and Cancellation of Checks

5. Linda Morris/Tax Director
e  Abatements for boards consideration

6. Natalie Pierce/County Planner

e Dietz Subdivision approved by County Commission Sept 18, 2012. Staff requests that the minutes of the
September 14 County Commission meeting reflect a recognition that the official approval date shown on the plat is
September 5, 2017.

e J Doll special use permit for an accessory dwelling unit on approx. 160 acres in the SW Y4 of Section 9, Township
140 N, Range 86 W, Morton County

e Final plat of a short-form subdivision known as Faehnrich Subdivision and a zoning map amendment from
Agricultural (A) District to Residential (R) District for approx. 5 acres in the SE 4 of Section 27, Township 140 N,
Range 82 W, Morton County.

e  The final plat of a short-form subdivision known as Old Mill Subdivision and a zoning map amendment from
Agricultural (A) District to Residential (R) District for approx. 10.03 acres in the NE % of Section 34, Township
140 N, Range 82 W, Morton County.

¢ Final Plat of a short-form subdivision known as Potter Subdivision and a zoning map amendment from
Agricultural (A) District to Residential (R) District for approx. 5 acres in the SE % of Section 15, Township 135 N,
Range 79 W, Morton County

8. Dawn Rhone/County Auditor
e 2018 Preliminary Budget

*ISSUES MAY BE ADDED OR DELETED BY MEETING DAY.



MORTON COUNTY COMMISSION SPECIAL MEETING
August 30, 2017

The Morton County Commission Special Meeting was called to order on August 30, 2017 at 4:30 PM by
Chairman Schulz at the Morton County Courthouse, 210 Second Avenue NW, Mandan, North Dakota.
Others present were Commissioners Zachmeier, Leingang, Boehm and Strinden and Auditor Rhone.
Leingang moved and Strinden seconded to approve the agenda. All voting aye, motion carried.
Strinden moved and Boehm seconded to approve out of state travel for Emergency Management
employees Cody Mattson and Joel Rostberg to attend the South Dakota Emergency Management
conference on September 13-14, 2017 in Deadwood, SD. All voting aye, motion carried.

Sheriff Kirchmeier presented the 2018 budgets for Corrections, Sheriff, Coroner and Communications.
Ron Manchester presented the 2018 budget for Lower Heart Water District.

Wade Bachmeier presented the 2018 budget for Morton County Water Resource District.

Jackie Hawes presented the 2018 budget for the Morton-Mandan Library.

Karla Meikle presented the 2018 budget request for the Morton County Fair Board.

Social Services Director Meier presented the 2018 Social Services budget.

County Engineer Aubol presented the 2018 Road Department budget.

Zachmeier moved and Leingang seconded to adjourn at 8:22 PM. All voting aye, motion carried.

Cody Schulz, Chairman, Morton County Commission

Dawn R Rhone, County Auditor




MORTON COUNTY COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
August 22, 2017

The Morton County Commission Regular Meeting was called to order on August 22, 2017 at 5:30 PM by
Chairman Schulz at the Morton County Courthouse, 210 Second Avenue NW, Mandan, North Dakota.
Others present were Commissioners Zachmeier, Leingang, Boehm and Strinden, Auditor Rhone, States
Attorney Koppy and Assistant States Attorney Grosinger.

Strinden moved and Boehm seconded to approve the agenda. All voting aye, motion carried.

Boehm moved and Strinden seconded to approve the minutes of the August 10, 2017 regular meeting
and the August 16, 2017 special meeting. All voting aye, motion carried.

Leingang moved and Boehm seconded to approve the bills. All voting aye, motion carried.

Strinden moved and Leingang seconded to allow the new Veterans’ Service Officer to work alongside the
current VSO for 2 months with an option for a third month if needed. All voting aye, motion carried.

Keith Johnson presented the 2018 Budget for Custer District Health.
Rocky Bateman and Beth McCleary presented the 2018 Morton County Soil Conservation District budget.
Nancy Keating presented the 2018 budget request for Centre Inc.

Leingang moved and Strinden seconded to approve homestead credit abatement #5045. All voting aye,
motion carried.

Boehm moved and Leingang seconded to approve reassessment abatement #5046. All voting aye,
motion carried.

Boehm moved and Leingang seconded to accept the two lowest bids (Sundre Sand and Gravel Inc &
Fisher Sand and Gravel Co) and approve the gravel crushing contract with Sundre Sand and Gravel Inc
at the rate of $5.38/CY. All voting aye, motion carried.

The total of all county funds expended from August 11, 2017 through August 22, 2017, equals
$309,943.76. A detailed list of funds expended by check is available for public inspection anytime during
regular business hours at the Morton County Auditor’s Office.

Leingang moved and Boehm seconded to adjourn at 6:16 PM. All voting aye, motion carried.

Cody Schulz, Chairman, Morton County Commission

Dawn R Rhone, County Auditor




09/12/201l7 TUE 17:09 FAX 701 222 2283 Gregory Ian Runge [@oo1/005

ANALYSIS OF 28 MORTON COUNTY MENTAL HEALTH CASES*

2016
Totals (Alleged type of disorder) Number Percent
Chemical 3 11%
Mental 14 50%
Both 11 39%
Total 28 100%
Totals (Action taken *) Number Percent
Waivers (actions with 1 or 2 Ws)** 15 47%
Dismissals (actions with D or DNA)*** 14 44%
Court (actions that start with a P)**** 3 9%
Total 32 100%

* Sometimes there are two waivers in one case.

Types of Cases

= Dismissal.
DNA = Dismissed/not approved.
= Waiver.
= Appeal
PT = Preliminary and Treatment Hearing (Attended).
WT = Waived Treatment Hearing.
WPD = Waived Preliminary Hearing; Dismissed.
PWT = Preliminary Hearing; Waived Treatment Hearing.
PHD = Preliminary Hearing; Dismissed.
PTD = Preliminary Hearing and Treatment Hearing and then was Dismissed.
WPT = Waived Preliminary and Treatment Hearing.
WPL = Waived Preliminary Hearing; Less Restrictive Treatment Order given.

WPTD=  Waived Preliminary Hearing; had Treatment Hearing; Dismissed
WPWT = Waived Preliminary Hearing: then Waived Treatment Hearing.

WTWM = Waived Treatment Hearing; then Waived Modification Hearing.
PTWR = Preliminary and Treatment Hearing; Waived the Request for a
‘Treatment Modification.



09/12/2017 TUE 17:09 ©FAX 701 222 2283 Gregory Ian Runge [Alco2/005

COMPARISON OF MORTON COUNTY CASES FROM 2015 TO 2016

2015 2016
No. % No. %
Total Disorders: 25 100% Total Disorders: 28  100%
Chemical: 2 8% Chemical: 3 11%
Mental: 12 48% Mental: 14 50%
Both: 11 44%, Both: 11 39%
Total Actions: 25 100% Total Actions: 32*%  100%
Waivers: 15 60% Waivers: 15 47%
Dismissals 4 16% Dismissals: 14 44%
Court 6 24% Court 3 9%

* Sometimes there are two waivers in one case.

There was a 10.7% increase from 2015 to 2016 in the number of cases in
Morton County.

Total number of cases filed for 2016 were 28. As of September 12" of 2017,
Morton County has filed 28 cases.



09/12/2017 TUE 17:10

FAX 701 222 2283 Gregory Ian Runge [fioo3/005
MENTAL HEALTH CASE ANALYSIS FOR 2016
County | Codes Jan | Feb Mar | Apr May | Jun Jul Aug | Sep Oct Nov |Dec | Total
Burleigh 8 7 11 20 14 14 15 10 13 17 24 16 16 177
Morton 30 0 2 1 2 1 1 2 5 4 2 4 4 28
Other 19 &35 1-19 1-19 1-35 | 3
Totals . 8 13 22 16 15 16 12 18 21 26 20 21 208
Disorder | Chem 1 2 3 5 3 3 2 3 3 5 4 1 35
Mental 2 7 14 7 5 8 4 6 8 8 7 16 92
Both 5 4 5 4 7 5 6 9 10 13 9 4 81
Totals 8 13 22 16 15 16 12 18 21 26 20 21 208
Actions | D 4 7 5 4 7 7 6 6 9 13 14 9 91
3 2 3 2 1 0 1 4 0 1 0 3 20 -
A 0 0 0 0 1 O 0 6] 0 O o) ¢] 1
PT 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 0 0 1 3
WT 0 0 0 2 1 1 1 1 2 1 1 0 10
WPD 0 2 2 1 2 1 1 1 1 0 1 2 14
PWT 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0 1 0 0 0 3
PHD 1 0 3 1 0 1 0 0 2 1 0 3 12
PTD 0 1 2 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 4
WPT 0 1 3 3 2 3 1 5 3 7 4 1 33
WPL 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 1
DNA 0 0 1 1 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 3
WPTD. 0 0 1 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 3
WPWT 0 0 0 1 1 1 0 1 1 1 0 2 8
WTWM 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1
PTWR 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 1
Totals | 8 |13 |22 46 |75 |16 |1z |18 {zr—{2s|20 121208
Mileage 10 25 139 60 45 75 55 104 144 152 48 160 1017




09/12/2017 TUE 17:11 FAX 701 222 2283 Gregory Ian Runge

ANALYSIS OF 208 CASES FOR 2016*

Total cases per county = Burleigh (177)  Morton (28) Other (3)
Totals (Alleged type of disorder) Number Percent
Chemical; 35 17%

Mental: 92 44%

Both: 81 39%

* Codes for Types of Cases (*some cases have more than one action taken)
D= Dismissal.

DNA = Dismissed; not approved.
= Waiver.
= Appeal
PT= Preliminary and Treatment Hearing (Attended).
WT = Waived Treatment Hearing,
WPD = Waived Preliminary Hearing; Dismissed.
PWT = Preliminary Hearing; Waived Treatment Hearing.
PHD = Preliminary Hearing; Dismissed.
PTD = Preliminary Hearing and Treatment Hearing and then was Dismissed.
WPT = Waived Preliminary and Treatment Hearing,.
WPL = Waived Preliminary Hearing; Less Restrictive Treatment Order given.

WPTD=  Waived Preliminary Hearing; had Treatment Hearing; Dismissed.

WPWT=  Waived Preliminary Hearing; then Waived Treatment Hearing.

WIWM= Waived Treatment Hearing; then Waived the Modification Hearing.

PTWR=  Preliminary and Treatment Hearing; Waived the Request for
Treatment Modification.

Totals (Action taken) Number(of actions) % of total actions
Waivers:(W,WT, WPD, PWT
WPT, WPL, WPTD, WPWT,
WTWM, PTWR)** 103 47%
Dismissals: (D, DNA, )*** 94 43%
Went to Court: (PT, PWT, PHD,
PTD, PTWR)#*##:x 23 10%
Total 220 100%

[floo4/005

¥ All cases with'a W code in them are included here. Some cases have two

W’s and are counted twice.
**%  All cases coded D or DNA included and dismissed before going to court,
waRk - All cases that start with a P are included here.



09/12/2017 TUE 17:12 FAX 701 222 2283 Gregory Ian Runge [Aoos/005

COMPARISON OF ALL CASES FROM 2015 TO 2016

2015 2016
No. % No. %

Total Disorders: 179 100% Total Disorders: 208 100%
Chemical: 36 20% Chemical: 35 17%
Mental: 72 40.3% Mental: 92 44%
Both: 71 39.7% Both: 81 39%
Total Actions: 179  100% Total Actions: 220* 100%
Waivers: 78 43.5% Waivers: 103 47%
Dismissals: 80 44.7% Dismissals: 94 43%
Court: 21 11.8 Court: 23 10%

* Applies only to 2016 case actions)

All cases with a W code in them are included here. Some cases have two
W’s and are counted twice.

All cases coded D or DNA included with dismissals.
All cases that start with a P are included with court cases.

There was a 13.9% increase in the total number of cases from 2015 to 2016.

By September 12, 2016, total cases were 129. As of September 12" of 2017, the
total number of cases are 170.

* Types of Cases (some cases have more than one action taken)




Bid Tab

2nd Floor Office Remodel
District Court Facilities

MORTON COUNTY

i L
d i
C
B e
(o] n
GENERAL CONTRACTORS i e BASE BID AIHG1 AtHG2 AHG3 Total
Addenda G1 Motorized Shades Add seating Re-paint frames
Re-varnish doors
Associated Builders X | X $531,000 $12,500 $6,200 $2,100 $551,800
Bismarck, ND
Northwest Contracting X | X $585,250 $12,885 $5,630 $2,400 $606,165
Bismarck, ND
Dakota West Contracting X | X $601,700 $13,000 $5,650 $2,150 $622,500
Bismarck, ND
Professional Contractors, Inc. No Bid
Bismarck, ND
Roers West No Bid
Dickinson, ND
ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS BASE BID Alt#E1 Alt#E2 Total
Addenda E1 Motorized Shades Replace heat pumps
RK Electric X | X $139,500 $1,000 $530 $141,030
Bismarck, ND
Heritage Electric X | x $142,397 $1,200 $800 $144,397
Mandan, ND
Skeel's Electric Co. X | X $145,498 $729 $750 $146,977
Bismarck, ND
L&H Electric X | X $144,815 $2,090 $1,040 $147,945
Bismarck, ND
Edling Electric, Inc. X | x $148,800 $1,430 $1,350 $151,580
Bismarck, ND
Bergstrom Electric X | X $151,275 $1,685 $1,480 $154,440
Grand Forks, ND
Fetzer Electric X| X $152,800 $2,600 $1,200 $156,600
Bismarck, ND
Frontier Electric, Inc. X | x $157,572 $1,260 $1,173 $160,005
Bismarck, ND
Electric Systems, Inc. X Bid Not Opened - No License
Bismarck, ND
| Fitterer ArchitectiPC
9/13/2017 (701)663-7543

September 12, 2017
4:00 PM

Page 1



Bid Tab

MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS BASE BID Alt#M1 Total
Addenda M1 Replace heat pumps
Central Mechanical $162,200 $30,000 $192,200
Mandan, ND
Cofell P&H $180,900 $39,500 $220,400
Bismarck, ND
Advanced Mechanical $191,360 $32,470 $223,830
Bismarck, ND
Cooling & Heating Unlimited $196,665 $30,257 $226,922
Bismarck, ND
City Air Mechanical $196,850 $36,350 $233,200
Bismarck, ND
Northern Plain P&H $217,150 $29,990 $247,140
Bismarck, ND
Fladeland Mechanical No Bid
Bismarck, ND
HA Thompson & Sons No Bid
Bismarck, ND
FP CONTRACTORS BASE BID
Addenda M1
Nova Fire Protection $67,630
Fargo, ND
Rapid Fire Protection $74,710
Bismarck, ND and Rapid City, SD
***APPARENT LOW BASE BIDDERS***
Base Bid Alternates
General Contractor - Associated Builders $531,000 $20,800
Mechanical Contractor - Central Mechanical $162,200 $30,000
Fire Protection Contractor - Nova Fire Protection $67,630 $0
Electrical Contractor - RK Electric $139,500 $1,530
$900,330 $52,330

NOTE: The Morton County Commission meets on Thursday, Sept. 14, 2017. It will be recommend that contracts be awarded at that time.

9/13/2017

MORTON COUNTY
2nd Floor Office Remodel
District Court Facilities

Total
$551,800
$192,200

$67,630

$141,030
$952,660

Al Fitterer Architect PC
(701)663-7543

September 12, 2017

4:00 PM

Page 2



Morton County Commission
Morton County Courthouse
210 2™ Ave NW

Mandan, N1D> 58554

(7015 6673414

Stewardship of Public Trust | Respest for Diverse Voives & fdeas | Responsive & Comprehensive Customer Serviee | Loadership with Ethics and integrity | Culiare of Teagnwork & Collaboratios

MEETING DATE: Sept 14, 2017
PREPARATION DATE: Sept 8, 2017
SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Treasurer
DEPARTMENT DIRECTOR:
PRESENTER: Vicki Lippert, Treasurer
Cancel Stale Checks & Pledges of
SUBJECT: Security

STATEMENT/PURPOSE: To cancel old checks and review the Pledges of Security

BACKGROUND/ALTERNATIVES:

ATTACHMENTS: 3 pages. (1) Cancellation of Checks and Pledges of Security (2)

FISCAL IMPACT: NA

STAFF IMPACT: NA

LEGAL REVIEW:NA

RECOMMENDATION:

SUGGESTED MOTION: To Cancel Checks and to approve the Pledges of Security

Page 1 of 1



MORTON COUNTY

STATE OF NORTH DAKOTA

MORTON COUNTY TREASURER

VICKI A LIPPERT

September 14, 2017

Morton County Commissioners

210 2™ Ave NW

Mandan ND 58554

Dear Sirs,

The following checks have been un-cashed for the past two years.

Cancellation of these checks is recommended by the State Auditor.

Accounts over $50.00 were notified by letter as required by law. These checks will be canceled and
sent to the State Unclaimed Property Division.

AUDITOR WARRANTS ACCOUNT # 1708

41129  1/14/2015  Dean Murphy ~ $13.53 Under $50.00  Send to the State
41503 10/28/2015 Waylan Buechler $39.68 Under $50.00  Send to the State

Total of Checks Sent To State: § 53.21

TREASURER CHECKS #30-090

13211 2/11/2015 Lamp Real Estate - $27.00 Under $50.00 Send to State
13223 2/27/2015 Not Always L8 LLC- $51.23 Sent Letter — No response

Total of Checks Sent to State: $ 78.23



Pledges of Security
(As of Sept 1, 2017)
Bremer Trust No Pledging Needed
WELLS FARGO

Well Fargo Checking Acct 30-090
Wells Fargo Saving Acct 841392509

Total:
Less FDIC Insurance
Total amount not covered by FDIC
X 110% Amount Needed for Pledges
Piedges of Security

Starion Financial

Certificates of Deposit: Morton County

Saving Account 10842113

Certificates of Deposit:  Morton County Parks
Total:

Less FDIC Coverage

Total amount not covered by FDIC

X 110 Amount Needed for Pledges

Pledges of Security

Dakota Community Bank Mandan & Hebron
Certificate of Deposit:  Morton County

Total:

FDIC insurance
Total Coverage

Bank of Glen Ullin
Certificate of Deposit ~ Morton County
FDIC Insurance

Pershing Bank- E-Connect
Certificates of Deposit Americian Express Bank Salt Lake City
Americian Express Centurion Bank
Discover Bank
Capital One Bank Natl Assoc.
Ally Bank
Goldman Sachs Bank
Compass Bank
Capital One Bank Natl Assoc.

BMW Bank  North Amercia Salt Lake City

Comenity Cap Bank Salt Lake City
Total

FDIC Insurance 10 @ 250,000.00 Total Coverage

1,398,271.81
1,169,016.70

2,567,288.51

250,000.00
2,317,288.51
2,549,017.36

18,025,772.56

556,133.39
1,001,811.68
102,099.31
1,660,044.38
250,000.00
1,410,044.38
1,651,048.82
1,893,733.75

208,3565.45

208,355.45

250,000.00
250,000.00

250,000.00
250,000.00

245,000.00
245,000.00
245,000.00
245,000.00
245,000.00
245,000.00
245,000.00
245,000.00
100,000.00
100,000.00

2,160,000.00
2,500,000.00



1st International Bank & Trust 250,000.00

FDIC Insurance 250,000.00
FDIC Insured Institutions Under ICS Acct:

Associated Bank NA 245,104.06

Bokf National Association 245, 104.06

Bank of the Ozarks 245,104.06

Cedar Rapids Bank & Trust 38,327.65

First United Bank & Trust 245,104.06

MetaBank 245,058.21

Morton Community Bank 245,104.06

The Park National Bank 245,104.06

Venture Bank 0.52

Total 1,754,010.74

FDIC Insurance 9 @ 250,000.00 Total Coverage 2,000,000.00




Morton County Commission
Morton County Courthouse
210 2™ Ave NW

Mandan, ND 58554

(701) 667.3414

Stewardship of Public Trust | Respect for Diverse Voices & Ideas | Responsive & Comprehensive Customer Service | Leadership with Ethics and Integrity | Culture of Teamwork & Collaboration

MEETING DATE: 8/14/2017

PREPARATION DATE: 8/11/2017

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: TAX DIRECTOR
DEPARTMENT DIRECTOR: LINDA MORRIS

PRESENTER: LINDA MORRIS

SUBJECT: ABATEMENT # 5047 AND 5048

STATEMENT/PURPOSE: ABATEMENTS ON  PARCELS 65-4151000  AS TAXPAYER
MITTLESTEADT QUALIFIES FOR THE WHEELCHAIR EXEMPTION* ON PARCEL LOCATED AT
1100 23RP ST SE MANDAN. *NDCC §57-02-08(20)

BACKGROUND/ALTERNATIVES: QUALIFY FOR AN EXEMPTION FOR THE ASSESSMENT YEARS
OF 2015 AND 2016 WITH A REDUCTION OF TAXES DOLLARS AND IS NOT REIMBURSED BY THE
STATE.

ATTACHMENTS: N/A

FISCAL IMPACT: 2015-$1259 AND 2016-$1,205

STAFF IMPACT: N/A

LEGAL REVIEW: N/A

RECOMMENDATION: RECOMMEND APPROVAL OF ABATEMENT # 5047 AND 5048 AS
APPLICANT QUALIFIES FOR THE EXEMPTION.

SUGGESTED MOTION: MOTION TO APPROVE ABATEMENTS AS PRESENTED

Page 1 of 1



DATE: 9/8/17
TO: MORTON COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: LINDA MORRIS, MORTON COUNTY TAX DIRECTOR
RE: SEPTEMBER 14, 2017 ABATEMENTS

TAX ABATEMENT TYPE OF PARCEL ORIGINAL OWNER NEW PROPERTY ABATED REASON FOR APPROVED
YEAR NUMBER ABATEMENT NUMBER VALUE VALUE ADDRESS VALUE ABATEMENT BY CITY
WHEELCHAIR WHEELCHAIR
2015 5047 EXEMPTION 654151000 $191,000 MITTELSTEADT $91,000 1100 23RD ST SE | § 100,000 EXEMPTION 9/5/2017
WHEELCHAIR WHEELCHARR
2016 5048 EXEMPTION 654151000 $190,400 MITTELSTEADT $90,400 1100 23RD ST SE | § 100,000 EXEMPTION 9/5/2017




P&Z SUMMARY | For SEPTEMBER 14, 2017 COMMISSION MEETING

1. The Dietz Subdivision was approved by County Commission Sept 18, 2012. The plat included a
signature block for the neighboring land owners to grant the right of way for County Rd 83. The
neighboring land owners were unwilling to sign the plat for a number of years. In recent months, the
applicants worked with legal counsel to come to an agreement with the neighboring land owners. The
plat is now recorded, but the signature block for the County Commission chairman reflects a County
Commission approval date of September 5, 2017. Staff requests that the minutes of the September

14% County Commission meeting reflect a recognition that the official approval date shown on the plat
is September 5, 2017.

2. J Doll special use permit for an accessory dwelling unit on approx. 160 acres in the SWV4 of Section
9, Township 140 N, Range 86 W, Morton County.

a. Summary: the accessory dwelling unit has been present on the property for a number of
years. The applicant wishes to establish a 911 address for the dwelling and is making a
special use permit application, retroactively, in order to do so.

Staff recommended approval with conditions.

b. P&Z Commission Action: recommended approval with the following conditions:

e The accessory dwelling unit shall be numbered with the address number.
e Along the private drive, just north of the approach off of County Road 140, the

applicant shall install a permanent sign or placard that displays the house number
of the accessory dwelling unit.

3. The final plat of a short-form subdivision known as Faehnrich Subdivision and a zoning map
amendment from Agricultural (A) District to Residential (R) District for approx. 5 acres in the SEV4 of
Section 27, Township 140 N, Range 82 W, Morton County.

a. Summary: applicant is entitled to construct a home on the 40 acres he owns. For the
purposes of financing the home, he intends to subdivide the 5 acres on which the home sits.
Construction of the home is nearly completed. Water service has been established at the
residence. And the approach has been approved and constructed.

Staff recommended approval.

b. P&Z Commission Action: recommended approval.

Morton County Department of Planning and Zoning
701-667-3361 | 2916 37" St. NW, Mandan, ND 58554 Page 1 of 2



4. The final plat of a short-form subdivision known as Old Mill Subdivision and a zoning map
amendment from Agricultural (A) District to Residential (R) District for approx. 10.03 acres in the NEV4
of Section 34, Township 140 N, Range 82 W, Morton County.

a. Summary: applicants are reconfiguring four lots to create two, 5-acre residential lots. The
existing lots are outlots and were never formally subdivided, though there is a long-
established residence on each lot. The two lots on which the homes sit are zoned
Residential, but the additional two lots are zoned Agricultural. As such a zoning map
amendment is required to bring the entirety of the proposed two lots into the Residential
District.

Staff recommended approval.
b. P&Z Commission Action: recommended approval.
5. The final plat of a short-form subdivision known as Potter Subdivision and a zoning map amendment

from Agricultural (A) District to Residential (R) District for approx. 5 acres in the SEV4 of Section 15,
Township 135 N, Range 79 W, Morton County.

a. Summary: applicant wishes to divide a 5 acre residential lot from a 352 acre tract for
the purpose of transferring the lot to the co-applicant to construct a residence. Rural water
service is not available to the subdivision. Electric service is available.

Staff recommended approval.

b. P&Z Commission Action: recommended approval.

Morton County Department of Planning and Zoning
701-667-3361 | 2916 37t St. NW, Mandan, ND 58554 Page 2 of 2
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J Doll Special Use Permit Zoning Map

Morton County Planning and Zoning Department

Created: 8/16/2017
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Proposed boundaries of site not exact.

For planning purposes only.






Faehnrich Subdivision Zoning Map

Morton County Planning and Zoning Department

Created: 8/16/2017
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Proposed boundaries of site not exact.
For planning purposes only.
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Old Mill Subdivision Zoning Map

Morton County Planning and Zoning Department

Created: 8/16/2017
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Proposed boundaries of site not exact.
For planning purposes only.
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Morton County Planning and Zoning Department
Potter Subdivision Zoning Map Created: 8/16,/2017
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